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WHAT ARE THE 
OBSTACLES?



2 in 3 
Nurses think you 

need to be an 
academic to engage 

in research

Money

65%
Say there is no time to 
teach or do research

Have an 
idea for a 
research 
project

60%

feel that there 
needs to be more 
evidence to back 
clinical practice

65%

Would like to try to do 
collaorative research as 

part of their clinical 
practice

24%

Knowledge

. 

31%
Would like to 
develop 
research skills

45%
Of nurses don’t 

believe they have 
enough 

knowledge to 
teach

Time



HOW DO WE OVERCOME THEM?

Start 
smallDo it!

Don’t compare your 
progress to others

Get help 
from more 
experienced 
researchers

Take some 
online courses

Read good pieces 
of research

analyse
Identify a 
problem and 
think about 
the solution

Don’t 
take no 
for an 
answer

Persevere

Work 
together



WHAT IS THE NSIG COMMITTEE DOING FOR YOU? 

Education Support

By providing eLearning 
opportunities via the 
ECFS education platform

Collaboration

By providing networking 
opportunities (NSIG Day) 
and a point of contact 
for those wishing to do 
cross center research 

Representation

By providing nursing 
representation on:
• Scientific Committee
• Education Committee
• Standards of Care 

Committee

Challenge

Through the provision 
of stimulating 
sessions at the NSIG 
day and the main 
conference.

By generating 
discussion and 
encouraging nurses 
to take part



WHAT CAN YOU DO FOR THE NSIG COMMITTEE? 

Participate Support

Support your 
colleagues who are 
brave enough to 
engage in research / 
education or 
development roles

Get involved

Get involved with the 
NSIG committee or 
volunteer to represent 
nursing on other 
committees (locally or 
internationally) 

Do!

Engage with 
colleagues at a local, 
national and 
international level. 
Encourage debate 
and the exchange of 
ideas

Start small and 
build on your 
successes



THOUGHTS?


